






Expenditures 

General Fund Summary 
May 2018 

1. Personnel Services- The costs for personnel services for the School District from 
the beginning of the fiscal year until May 31, 2018 was $40,696,560.68. This was 
an increase of 2.7% above last year at this time. $3,514,649.06 was spent in May.

2. Benefits - The cost for benefits for the School District from the beginning of the 
fiscal year until May 31, 2018 was $15,365,995.69. This was an increase of 6.2%
above last year at this time. $1,408,484.45 was spent in May.

3. Purchased Services - The cost for purchased services for the district from the 
beginning of the fiscal year until May 31, 2018 total $8,297,850.89. This was a 
3.0% decrease below last year at this time. $878,497.51 was spent in May. 
Professional Services, Repairs and Services, Rentals, Security Services - PAC, 
Postage, Advertising, Electricity, Water/Sewer, and Community Schools account 
for the decrease.

4. Supplies and Materials - The cost for supplies and materials for the district from 
the beginning of the fiscal year until May 31, 2018 total $1,531,844.96. This was 
a 0.6% decrease below last year at this time. Office Supplies, Nursing Supplies, 
Subscriptions, Electronic Subscriptions, Computer/Maintenance Supplies, and 
Transportation Supplies account for this decrease $100,462.42 was spent in May.

5. Capital Outlay- The cost for capital outlay for the district from the beginning of 
the fiscal year until May 31, 2018 total $1,013,837.87. This was a 14.5% increase 
above last year at this time and was mainly due to Classroom Technology, Middle 
School, District New Equipment, Maintenance, and Transportation Equipment.
$45,779.76 was spent in May.

6. Other - The cost of other expenditures excluding transfers for the district was
$1,734,305.20 for the fiscal year until May 31, 2018. This was a 5.1 % increase 
above last year at this time. $8,654.03 was spent in May. Dues/Fees, Fiscal 
Audit, Election Expense, and Awards/Prizes make up the majority of this increase. 






































































































































































